AGENDA
Special Infrastructure Committee
Thursday, May 14, 2019
@ 4:30 PM

1.

Call to Order

2.

Suspension of Rules

3.

Resolution
• Bid Award for Hot Water Pipe Replacement at Courthouse

4. Miscellaneous
5. Adjournment

AGENDA BRIEFING
COMMITTEES: County Infrastructure Committee
MEETING DATE: May 14, 2020
TYPE

DESCRIPTION

LINE ITEM

AMOUNT

EXPENSE:

Building Improvement

062-4-062-7-738-55107

$53,124.00

ISSUE:
The 3” galvanized hot water pipe (GHWP) that starts in the basement Mechanical Room of the Old
Side of the Courthouse, runs in the basement level through the Dirt Room, and into the basement of
the New Side of the Courthouse. The GHWP runs above the hard ceiling in the Secure Hallway of the
Jail area and into the basement of the Mechanical Room of the New Side where it ties into the copper
pipe that runs up through the New Side of the Courthouse. This GHWP has developed numerous
leaks and is in danger of imminent failure. This GHWP needs to be replaced before it totally fails.
BACKGROUND/DISCUSSION:
CH-20-007 Courthouse 3” Hot Water Pipe Replacement was established to replace the faulty GHWP
that supplies tempered hot water to the entire New Side of the Courthouse. Funding was established
at $100,000.00 This GHWP supplies all hand sinks and mop sinks from the basement level through
the fifth-floor level of the New Side of the Courthouse. There are numerous repair clamps on this
GHWP that allow the GHWP to remain in service at this time. This GHWP needs to be replaced at the
earliest timeframe to allow the replacement to be done in a somewhat controlled fashion in lieu of
replacing it under an emergency condition. The cause of the GHWP deterioration has been attributed
to electrolysis that resulted from electrical heat trace lines installed in contact with the GHWP and
under the 2” pipe insulation. The electrical heat trace line designed to help keep the GHWP warm
along its 540 Lineal feet. The electrical heat trace line was de-energized in 2019 in an attempt to
decrease the rate of pin holes occurring as a result of the electrolysis. There has been no real
temperature loss in the tempered GHWP once the water usage was sufficient to get the tempered hot
water throughout the New Side of the Courthouse. As a result, Staff analyzed various types of pipe
material to use for the GHWP replacement. Galvanized pipe was ruled out because the last
replacement of galvanized pipe lasted only 8-Years. It should have lasted 30-Years. Copper pipe was
ruled out as being too costly. Various plastic pipes were investigated with Type “A” PEX pipe being the
pipe material of choice. PEX piping has been used in Europe for over 40-Years with great success.
PEX pipe has been used in the US for a much less timeframe, but with great success. Staff reviewed
piping options with several Plumbing Companies and the Plumbers Union. Type “A” PEX consistently
came out as the recommended pipe material for our application.
A Scope-Of-Work and a Price Sheet was developed for this work. Bid Package 05-01-20 titled “Hot
Water Pipe Replacement Peoria County Courthouse was issued on 04-24-20. Over 87-Vendors were
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notified, 15-Vendors downloaded the documents, 4-Vendors attended the mandatory Pre-Bid
Meeting, and 3-Vendors provided bids.
Staff (Facilities and Finance) reviewed the Bids. Illini Plumbing Inc. (Illini) was the apparent low
Bidder. Staff followed up with Illini after the bid opening. Staff asked Illini several questions to verify
that Illini had a thorough knowledge of the Project, had a complete bid, had no bid disqualifications,
and was prepared to start and do the work if awarded the Bid. Staff sent Illini a confirmation email
asking Illini to review and confirm our communication. Dries Brothers Plumbing, Inc. (Dries) and
TCI Companies, Inc. (TCI) were the other Bidders. Stoops Plumbing (Stoops) did not bid. See Bid
Results below.
Bidder

Base Bid

Dries Brothers Plumbing, Inc.
Illini Plumbing Inc.
TCI Companies, Inc.
Stoops Plumbing
Overtime (Est.)
Contingency
Total Fund Request

$44,800.00
$37,998.00
$59,950.00
No Bid

Voluntary
Alternate
No Bid
No Bid
$55,500.00
No Bid

Totals (Excluding
Voluntary Alternate)
$44,800.00
$37,998.00
$59,950.00
No Bid
$10,296.00
$4,830.00
$53,124.00

Staff is recommending that Illini be awarded the Bid for the Hot Water Pipe Replacement Bid Package
05-01-20 at their Base Bid of $37,998.00 plus the possible use of overtime to do some of the work.
Staff also requests Contingency Funding of $4,830.00 be established for this work at this time.
Staff is further requesting that the County Administrator, with the approval of SAO, shall oversee the
issuances of the necessary Purchase Orders, Change Orders, and other Documents necessary to
accomplish this Work with Illini.

COUNTY BOARD GOALS:
Infrastructure Stewardship

STAFF RECOMMENDATION:
Approve the commitment of $53,124.00 to this Project CH-20-007, Bid Package 05-01-20. Approve
Illini’s Bid of $37,998.00. Approve overtime for Illini to do work on off hours at $10,296.00,
estimated. Approve a contingency of $4,830.00 for this Project. Authorize the County Administrator,
with the approval of SAO, to issue necessary documents to complete this portion of the Project with
ECSI.
________________________________________________________________
COMMITTEES ACTION:

PREPARED BY: Daniel O’Connell, Director, Facilities and Grounds Operations
DATE: May 12, 2020
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COUNTY OF PEORIA

PURCHASING DIVISION
PEORIA COUNTY COURTHOUSE
324 MAIN STREET - ROOM 501
PEORIA IL 61602

BID REPORT

TO:

HONORABLE MEMBERS OF THE PEORIA COUNTY BOARD
SCOTT SORREL, PEORIA COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR

FROM:

JIM SMITH, CPPO, CPPB PURCHASING AGENT

SUBJECT:

BID # 05-01-20: HOT WATER PIPE REPLACEMENT PEORIA COUNTY
COURTHOUSE

DATE:

MAY 12, 2020

CC:

DAN O’CONNELL, FACILITIES DIRECTOR

This office, on behalf of Facilities, solicited bids for Hot Water Pipe Replacement at the Peoria County
Courthouse. Eighty-Seven vendors were notified, fifteen (15) vendors downloaded the documents and
Three (3) vendor responses were received. The attached tabulation represents all bids received.
Additional bid document information may be required in selecting a bidder. This report does not evaluate
specification compliance to the specifications in the RFP.

Bid tab bid 05-01-20 Hot Water Pipe Replacement Peoria County Courthouse

Vendor

Dries Bros. Plumbing Inc.
Peoria IL
Illini Plumbing
Peoria IL
TCI Plumbing
Goodfield IL
All required documents were submitted
with responses

Base bid

Alternate bid

$

44,800.00

$

37,998.00

$

59,950.00 $

4

55,500.00
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TO THE HONORABLE COUNTY BOARD
COUNTY OF PEORIA, ILLINOIS

)
)
)

Your County Infrastructure Committee does hereby recommend passage of the following
Resolution:
RE: Approval of Illini Plumbing Inc.’s (Illini) Bid for Bid Package #05-01-20 for Hot
Water Pipe Replacement Peoria County Courthouse; authorize Illini to use
overtime to do some of their work, establish a contingency; and to authorize the
County Administrator, with the approval of SAO, to issue the necessary
documents for this Project with Illini.
RESOLUTION
WHEREAS, your County Infrastructure Committee recommends that the County Board
approve the necessary funds for this Project at an overall estimated cost of $53,124.00 and
WHEREAS, your County Infrastructure Committee recommends that the County Board
approve Illini’s Bid of $37,998.00, at straight time rates, to furnish and install all work indicated
for this Project; and
WHEREAS, your County Infrastructure Committee recommends to the County Board that
authorizes Illini to do some of their work on an overtime basis to allow for other activities in the
Courthouse to operate with minimal impedance. That overtime cost is estimated to be an
additional cost of $10,296.00 and will be monitored by Staff; and
WHEREAS, your County Infrastructure Committee recommends that the County Board
authorize a construction contingency of $4,830.00 for this Project; and
WHEREAS, your County Infrastructure Committee recommends that the County Board
authorize the County Administrator, with the approval of SAO, to issue the necessary documents
for this Project with Illini;
NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, by the Peoria County Board, that funds in the
amount of Fifty-Three Thousand One Hundred Twenty-Four Dollars ($53,124.00) be
appropriated into Line Item 062-4-062-7-738-55107 for the Project and that the County
Administrator, with the approval of SAO, is authorized to execute the necessary documents for
this phase of the Project with Illini.
RESPECTFULLY SUBMITTED,
County Infrastructure Committee
Date: May 14, 2020
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